
Judges 3 Idolatry Leads to Servitude 

Now these are the nations that the LORD left, to test Israel by them (that is, all the 
Israelites who had not experienced any of the wars of Canaan; 2 only in order that the 
generations of the sons of Israel might be taught war, those who had not experienced it 
previously). 

3 These nations are: the five governors of the Philistines and all the Canaanites and the 
Sidonians, and the Hivites who lived on Mount Lebanon, from Mount Baal-hermon as far 
as Lebo-hamath. 4 They were left to test Israel by them, to find out if they would obey 
the commandments of the LORD, which He had commanded their fathers through 
Moses. 

5 The sons of Israel lived among the Canaanites, the Hittites, the Amorites, the 
Perizzites, the Hivites, and the Jebusites; 6 and they took their daughters for themselves 
as wives, and gave their own daughters to their sons, and served their gods. 

7 So the sons of Israel did what was evil in the sight of the LORD, and they forgot the 
LORD their God and served the Baals and the Asheroth. 8 Then the anger of the LORD 
was kindled against Israel, so that He sold them into the hand of Cushan-rishathaim, 
king of Mesopotamia; and the sons of Israel served Cushan-rishathaim for eight years. 

The First Judge Frees Israel 

9 But the sons of Israel cried out to the LORD, and the LORD raised up a deliverer for the 
sons of Israel to set them free, Othniel the son of Kenaz, Caleb’s younger brother. 10 
And the Spirit of the LORD came upon him, and he judged Israel. When he went to war, 
the LORD handed over to him Cushan-rishathaim king of Mesopotamia, so that he 
prevailed over Cushan-rishathaim. 11 Then the land was at rest for forty years. And 
Othniel the son of Kenaz died. 

12 Now the sons of Israel again did evil in the sight of the LORD. So the LORD 
strengthened Eglon the king of Moab against Israel, because they had done evil in the 
sight of the LORD. 13 And he gathered to himself the sons of Ammon and Amalek; and 
he went and defeated Israel, and they took possession of the city of the palm trees. 14 
And the sons of Israel served Eglon the king of Moab for eighteen years. 

Ehud Kills Eglon 

15 But when the sons of Israel cried out to the LORD, the LORD raised up a deliverer for 
them, Ehud the son of Gera, the Benjaminite, a left-handed man. And the sons of Israel 
sent tribute by him to Eglon the king of Moab. 16 Now Ehud made himself a sword which 
had two edges, a cubit in length, and he strapped it on his right thigh under his cloak. 

17 Then he presented the tribute to Eglon king of Moab. Now Eglon was a very fat man. 
18 And it came about, when he had finished presenting the tribute, that Ehud sent away 



the people who had carried the tribute. 19 But he himself turned back from the idols 
which were at Gilgal, and said, “I have a secret message for you, O king.” And the king 
said, “Silence!” And all who were attending him left him. 

20 Then Ehud came to him while he was sitting in his cool roof chamber alone. And 
Ehud said, “I have a message from God for you.” And he got up from his seat. 21 Then 
Ehud reached out with his left hand and took the sword from his right thigh, and thrust it 
into his belly. 22 The hilt of the sword also went in after the blade, and the fat closed 
over the blade because he did not pull the sword out of his belly; and the refuse came 
out. 

23 Then Ehud went out into the vestibule, and shut the doors of the roof chamber 
behind him, and locked them.24 When he had left, the king’s servants came and 
looked, and behold, the doors of the roof chamber were locked; and they said, 
“Undoubtedly he is relieving himself in the cool room.” 25 So they waited until it would 
have been shameful to wait longer; but behold, he did not open the doors of the roof 
chamber. So they took the key and opened them, and behold, their master had fallen to 
the floor dead. 

 

26 Now Ehud escaped while they were hesitating, and he passed by the idols and 
escaped to Seirah. 27 And when he arrived, he blew the trumpet in the hill country of 
Ephraim; and the sons of Israel went down with him from the hill country, and he was 
leading them. 28 Then he said to them, “Pursue them, for the LORD has handed your 
enemies the Moabites over to you.” So they went down after him and took control of the 
crossing places of the Jordan opposite Moab, and did not allow anyone to cross. 

29 They struck and killed about ten thousand Moabites at that time, all robust and 
valiant men; and no one escaped. 30 So Moab was subdued that day under the hand of 
Israel. And the land was at rest for eighty years. 31 Now after him came Shamgar the 
son of Anath, who struck and killed six hundred Philistines with an oxgoad; and he also 
saved Israel. 

We will use five tools on our expedition that are built around five questions 

• What questions were provoked within you? 

• Did anything confuse you? 

• Did anything move you emotionally? 

• Did God instruct you to do something? 

• Did you gain any insight into God’s character? 

 



Paul’s helpful insights and questions 

1. God had a strategy to keep the nation of Israel accustomed to being a nation of war. 

2. He used the hostility of the surrounding nations to test Israel’s faithfulness. Does He 
still do this with Christians? 

3. When God commanded Israel’s forefathers to do something He expected their 
children to obey this instruction. Does that still apply today? 

4. Can you imagine what it must have been like living as a nation in the middle of hostile 
nations? Oh, they still do! 

5. Why was it a problem to God if the nations intermarried with Israel? 

6. What evil did Israel do to upset God? What evil do you do to upset God? 

7. Having been chosen as a ‘holy nation’ why did they forget the God of their forefathers? 

8. Even though they were chosen, in serving the Baals and the Asheroths, they became 
to God as those of the evil nations before them. 

9. When Israel stepped out of the relationship with God they lost the blessing of His 
protection. 

10. Despite Israel’s unfaithfulness, when they cried out for God to save them, He would 
send deliverers called Judges. 

11. The Spirit of the Lord came upon Caleb’s younger brother, Othniel, to lead Israel out 
of captivity, so they had rest for forty years. 

12. But after Othniels’ death they were unfaithful again. 

13. Israel’s enemy, Eglon, was strengthened and took Israel back into captivity, he also 
took charge of the city of palm trees – Jerusalem. 

14. Israel was held in captivity for eighteen years until she cried out to God for mercy 
and deliverance again. 

15. Ehad became judge, he was a left handed man, he created a strategy to kill Eglon 
and recaptures Israel’s freedom for eighty years. 

16. Eglon was a fat man as the sword that pierced his belly was engulfed by the fat. 

17. Could his servants of saved him if they had not assumed he was on the loo? 

18. Anxiety motivated them to breach Eglon’s privacy. 

19. Ehad took advantage of the time delay and attacked Moab with his army to 
recapture Israel’s freedom. 



20. The call to war came from the sound of the trumpet blast. Why is a trumpet used in 
this way? 

21. Notice how Ehad saw that it was God who was bringing Israel’s freedom. 

22. Notice Israel took back the fords to control the water and those who crossed the 
bridges. 

23. Moab became Israels slave by the hand of God, through Ehad. 

24. Shamgar extended Israels freedom by destroying six hundred men by a bone. 


